
Page 1 of 4

$2,713.49000 $21.36575  $               5,588.76000  $           1,259.26600 

BRAND/STK NO Shamrock Scientific M6260-2 GA International GANHTT121C32W
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

1000/pk pk 1 ea/ea (200 labels/roll)
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                           8.92  $                          0.01  $                          73.60  $                      73.60 

BRAND/STK NO Leica L3800421 Azer Scientific AZRES733
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 5678 ml/cs 6pk/cs cs 4 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         50.98  $                          0.01  $                        183.39  $                      45.85 

BRAND/STK NO Leica 3801741 NO BID NO BID 
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 64 oz/cs cs NO BID NO BID 
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         66.31  $                          1.04 NO BID NO BID 

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CL60 Azer Scientific AZR-PFNBF-40
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 72/cs cs 48 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         27.23  $                          0.34  $                          19.05  $                         0.40 

BRAND/STK NO Leica 3803105 Surgipath AWN3803107
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 16 oz/ea ea 1 ea/ea 
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         34.13  $                          2.13  $                        500.92  $                    500.92 

BRAND/STK NO Cardianl CH105WX Azer Scientific AZREMS200WPLS
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1440/cs cs 1440 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       193.64  $                          0.13  $                        376.77  $                    376.77 

BRAND/STK NO CH-7154-G Cardinal Azer Scientific AZRRAP-FRZ
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 121/cs cs 12 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       105.00  $                          0.88  $                        132.91  $                      11.08 

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH5056B Simport Scientific SMPM5086
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1500/cs cs 1000 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       125.00  $                          0.08  $                        254.44  $                         0.25 

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH5054G Simport Scientific SMPM5084
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1500/cs cs 1000 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       125.00  $                          0.08  $                        254.44  $                         0.25 

1 2

Decalcifier II  6 qts/case #00421 Leica Biosystems or approved equal

Clearium Mounting Media 4/case #01101 Leica Biosystems,  NO SUBSTITUTE   

Buffered Neutral Formalin 30mL Containers 50/CS. #0070 Leica Biosystems or approved equal

Sta-on Tissue Section Adhesive pt. #03105 Leica Biosystems or approved equal

Microscope Slides X-tra White #00210 Leica Biosystems or approved equal

Frostbite, #03100 Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal 

7

8

9

Cassettes, Blue  15-182-500D Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal 

Cassettes, Green  15-182-500C Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal 

Bid Tabulation
ITB 51 - 19 "HISTOLOGY SUPPLIES"
Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer
johnsonre@jccal.org 

 CARDINAL  MEDLINE 
GRAND TOTAL
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Microscope slide labels, 15/16" x 15/16", std thickness imprinted Pathology White & Colors Leica Biosystems #02025 or approved equal

mailto:johnsonre@jccal.org
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BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH5052W Simport Scientific SMPM5082
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1500/cs cs 1000 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       125.00  $                          0.08  $                        254.44  $                         0.25 

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH5053P Simport Scientific SMPM5083
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1500/cs cs 1000 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       125.00  $                          0.08  $                        254.44  $                         0.25 

BRAND/STK NO Leica 3801360 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 20 lb/cs cs NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         75.86  $                          3.79 NO BID NO BID

BRAND/STK NO Leica 3803591 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 2000 ml/cs cs NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       220.82  $                          0.11 NO BID NO BID

BRAND/STK NO Leica 3803591 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 2000 ml/cs cs NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 95.21 0.0476 NO BID NO BID

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal M6045-9A Azer Scientific AZR112450
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10 oz/ea ea 10 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                           4.20  $                          0.42  $                          47.77  $                         4.78 

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal C4330 Azer Scientific AZRES609
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 4/cs 512 oz/cs cs 4 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         54.21  $                          0.11  $                          60.13  $                      15.03 

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal C4305 Medline MCHEM140
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 4/cs 512 oz/cs cs 4 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         50.00  $                    0.09766  $                          91.13  $                      22.78 

BRAND/STK NO Leica L3801800 Azer Scientific AZRES34841
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1419.53 ml/cs cs 6 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         64.30  $                          0.45  $                          48.11  $                         8.02 

Xylene (4 gallon/case) Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal

Alcohol-Isopropyl (4 gallon/case) Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal 
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Cassettes, White 22-038203 Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal 

Cassettes, Pink Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal 

Blue Buffer, I gallon Leica Biosystems,  NO SUBSTITUTE   

Define Clarifier, 1 gallon Leica Biosystems,  NO SUBSTITUTE   

Hematoxylin, 4 pt./case Leica Biosystems,  NO SUBSTITUTE   

Cover Slips 50 x 24 x 1mm Leica Biosystems, or approved equal

18

Cytology Fixative Leica Biosystems,  or approved equal 

PLEASE ENTER COMPANY NAME ---------> 
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BRAND/STK NO Leica L3801360 Stalab STLB145
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 20 lb/cs cs 10 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         75.86  $                          3.79  $                        126.49  $                      12.65 

BRAND/STK NO BD 4312515A BD BDD212515
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000 ml/sp sp 4 ea/pk
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       143.53  $                    0.14300  $                        200.71  $                      50.18 

BRAND/STK NO ThermoFisher S7439-5 Azer Scientific AZRES7037
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1892.68 ml/cs cs 4 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       101.36  $                    0.05356  $                        376.15  $                      94.04 

BRAND/STK NO CHP1220 Cardinal Azer Scientific AZRES001
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 12/bx bx 12 ea/bx
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         21.90  $                    1.82500  $                          40.15  $                         3.35 

BRAND/STK NO Sakura C1660-6 Sakura MLV4329
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 200/cs cs 200 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       343.33  $                    1.71600 700.25 3.5

BRAND/STK NO Sakura C1660-7 Sakura MLV4335
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 200/cs cs 200 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         84.86  $                    0.42300  $                        168.47  $                         0.84 

BRAND/STK NO Sakura C1660-9 ThermoScientific MLV4336
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 200/cs cs 200 ea/pk
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         23.27  $                    0.52780  $                        964.57  $                         4.82 

BRAND/STK NO Sakura C1660-5 ThermoScientific MLV4333
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 200/cs cs 200 ea/pk
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       105.56  $                    0.52780  $                        207.23  $                         1.04 

BRAND/STK NO Leica 3801616 Azer Scientific AZRES36011
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 2000 ml/cs cs 4 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         23.51  $                    0.04938  $                        105.47  $                      26.37 

BRAND/STK NO Sakura M7321-51 Azer Scientific AZRES33675
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 50/pk pk 50 ea/pk
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         95.00  $                    1.90000  $                        107.65  $                         2.15 

Plastic Chamber, 1ml cap, 200/case Cardinal Health #C1660-7 or approved equal
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25

Blue Ribbon Parrafin Leica Biosystems,  NO SUBSTITUTE   

TB Auramine-Rhodamine T BD #212515

19

20

28

Accu-Edge High Profile blades Sakura brand 4685  NO SUBSTITUTION

PLEASE ENTER COMPANY NAME ---------> 

Plastic Chamber Holder, 1ml, 200/case Cardinal Health #C-1660-9      or approved equal          

Filter paper, 1ml, 200/case, Accu Edge Cardinal Health #C1660-5 or approved equal

Alcoholic Eosin Y 515 Leica brand 3801616 NO SUBSTITUTION

Cytostain, 1 pint; #7511, Thermo Fisher Scientific or approved equal

Mer Marker, platinum line Mercedes Medical or approved equal

Plastic Chamber, 1ml Cardinal Health # C1660-6 or approved equal
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BRAND/STK NO Sakura M7135-10 Elkay EPCHD15RE
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 250/cs cs 500 ea/cs
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                       113.33  $                    0.45320  $                          40.08  $                         0.08 

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal C4320-101 Azer Scientific NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 512 oz/cs cs NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                         31.17  $                    0.06088 NO BID

1 Cardinal Health
2 Medline Industries 

0%

MAXIMUM DISCOUNT

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd year 
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd year 

15% 0%
15%

Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES

29

30

PLEASE ENTER COMPANY NAME ---------> 
Mictotome Waste Collection Bags Sakura brand 4658 M7135-10

10% Buffered Formalin Neutral C4320-01

Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES

Delivery guaranteed not later than _ _  days after order date. 2 2

REQUIRED FORMS

Price Sheet YES YES

CONTACT INFORMATION
4564 Riverview Drive, Hoover, AL 35244 | Linda Gregg  P:  205.910.1703  E: linda.gregg @cardinalhealth.com
Three Lakes Drive, Northfield, IL 60093 | David Rolston P: 800.633.5463  E: govbids@medline.com

EEOC Form YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES

Signature Page YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES


	Sheet1

